



BID OPENING BIDDER'S TABULATION PRICING

IFB: Printing/Mailing of August 2019 Full Voter Canvass

Bid Opening Date: Wednesday, July 24, 2019 at 10:00 AM Central Time
69 West Washington, 8th Floor-Conference Room
Chicago, IL 60602

Bidder	Bidder's Contact Name	NCOA Screening Approx. 1.6 Million Voter Records PER THOUSAND		Mailing Approx. 1.4 Million Return Service Requested Voter Notices PER THOUSAND		Mailing Approx. 200,000 Voter Records PER THOUSAND
--------	-----------------------	--	--	--	--	--

1. Lake County Press	James Wicklander	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID
2. Elk Grove Graphics	Chris Diemand	\$1.53		\$76.70		\$82.42
3. Schiele Group	Jim Hortsman	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID
4. Liberty Creative Solutions	Jeff Hofer	\$2.50		\$109.89		\$111.60
5. Johnson & Quin Inc.	Robert Arkema	\$1.00		\$57.25		\$66.20
6. Cardinal Color Group	A.J. LeBeau	\$1.00		\$53.12		\$58.905
7. JJ Collins	Mike Pickrum	\$1.15		\$59.80		\$80.00
8. Pelegan, Inc.	Gayle Egan	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID
9. Sommers & Fahrenbach	Bob Walsh	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID