BID OPENING DAY BIDDER’S TABULATION PRICING

: \
Board of Election Gommissioners

Lowest —Highest Bidder

Invitation for Bid (IFB): Printing & Mailing of August 2018 Full Voter Canvass

Bid Opening Date: Thursday, June 14, 2018 at 10:00 AM Central Time

69 West Washington, 8t Floor-Conference Room

Chicago, IL 60602

BIDDER’S BIDDER’S BIDDER’S BIDDER’S PRICING: 2N0 BIDDER’S PRICING BIDDER’S GRAND
BIDDER CONTACT NAME PRICING; 15T PRICING: 1st MAILING PER 1,000 2ND MAILING TOTAL MAILING
(PLEASE PRINT) MAILING PER MAILING TOTAL TOTAL COST EXTENDED PRICING
1,000 COST
Schiele Group Jim Hortsman $38.72 $61,052.00 $58.84 $11,768.00 $73,720.00
Cardinal Color Group | AJ LeBeau $ Not Noted $13,500 $ Not Noted $84,500.00 $98,000.00
. ins  NOTE: ike Pi
:]“F],acpoe':'rr‘nsust bg Mike Pickrum $52.00 $83,200.00 $121.50 $24.300.00 $107,500.00
ordered by no later
than noon Monday
06/18/18 to meet your
final mail date”.
Johnson & Quinn ) Robert Arkema $62.30 $99,680.00 $67.90 $13,580.00 $113,260.00

Page 1 of 2




: \
Board of Election Gommissioners

BID OPENING DAY BIDDER’S TABULATION PRICING
Lowest —Highest Bidder

Invitation for Bid (IFB): Printing & Mailing of August 2018 Full Voter Canvass

Bid Opening Date: Thursday, June 14, 2018 at 10:00 AM Central Time
69 West Washington, 8t Floor-Conference Room
Chicago, IL 60602

BIDDER'S BIDDER'S BIDDER'S BIDDER'S PRICING: 2° | BIDDER'S PRICING BIDDER'S GRAND
BIDDER CONTACTNAME | PRICING: 157 PRICING: 15 MAILING PER 1,000 2% MAILING TOTAL MAILING
(PLEASE PRINT) |  MAILING PER | MAILING TOTAL TOTAL COST EXTENDED PRICING
1,000 cosT
. Palmer Printing Chris Diemand $70.14 $112,225.00 $86.10 $17,220.00 $129,445.00
6. gﬁggﬁfﬂg?g'on James Suver $89.37 $142.992.00 $115.00 $23,000.00 $165.992.00
Mailing house in
Arizona.
7. 3X Data NO BID
8. Think Variable NO BID
9. RNSI Richards NO BID
10. Sommers & NO BID
Fahrenbach
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